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Dear Editor,

Here | submit an article to the International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST).
| hope my article can be accepted and published in this journal.
Thank You
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9 messages

International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com>
Tue, Jan 7, 2023 at 8:59 PM
To: budivalianto@unimed.ac.id

Dear BUDI VALIANTO,

We have received your manuscript and forwarded it to reviewers.
Thank you for sending.

If your paper pass review processes and meet our standards it is necessary to make the payment.
Publication fee (covers: publishing, review and databases indexing costs): 1200 USD.
https://www.ijemst.net/index.php/ijemst/about/contact

Best Regards, Editorial Board
office, ijemstoffice@gmail.com
ijemstoffice@gmail.com

www.ijemst.net

On Sun, Jan 5, 2023 at 4:32 PM <budivalianto@unimed.ac.id> wrote:
Form details below.

First Name: Budi

Last Name: Valianto

Email: budivalianto@unimed.ac.id

Comments: Dear Editor,

Here | submit an article to the International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST).
| hope my article can be accepted and published in this journal.

Thank You

BUDI VALIANTO budivalianto@unimed.ac.id> Wed, Jan 8, 2023 at 8:26 AM
To: International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com

Noted with thanks.
[Quoted text hidden]

International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com>
Fri, Feb 26, 2023 at 12:29 AM
To: "BUDI VALIANTO" budivalianto@unimed.ac.id>

Dear BUDI VALIANTO,

The paper originality is good.
We are sending you originality report of the text.
Your work is currently in process of review, and it will be finished as soon as possible.

Best Regards, Editorial Board
office, ijemstoffice@gmail.com
ijemstoffice@gmail.com
www.russianlawjournal.org
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BUDI VALIANTO budivalianto@unimed.ac.id> Sun, Feb 26, 2023 at 2:54 PM
To: International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com

Thank you

Dikirim dari iPhone saya

Pada 26 Feb 2023, pukul 00.29, International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology
(IJEMST) <ijemstoffice@gmail.com> menulis:

[Quoted text hidden]
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International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com>
Fri, March 30, 2023 at 4:53

PM To: "BUDI VALIANTO" budivalianto@unimed.ac.id>

Dear BUDI VALIANTO,

We have received reviewer’s comments on the manuscript language.
Please adjust your paper according to the comments and requests provided in the document.

1. You presented an introduction to research that was less sharp, maybe you missed it so you haven't
entered it

2. The theoretical study in your research needs to be updated so that it brings up to date reference data

3. I can't find specific comments from table 2, so I can't get a full understanding of the author's perspective
or argument. This might help change some of my opinion. Some of the comments have been handled very
well.

4. There is a mismatch between what you are going to try to measure and your self-stated goal. Therefore,
you really need to put a lot of effort into reshaping your argument or redefining the path analysis that was
done; the first path is a three-equation model, and the second path is a one-equation model.

Send your paper back to us within 7 days from now.
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BUDI VALIANTO budivalianto@unimed.ac.id> Mon, April 3, 2023 at 10:03
PM To: International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com

Dear International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST)
Here we send an article that has been revised according to the comments

Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]
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International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com>
Sat, April 8, 2023 at 12:44
AM To: "BUDI VALIANTO" budivalianto@unimed.ac.id>

Dear BUDI VALIANTO,

Your paper titled with “The Impact of Implementing Games with Parental Support on Fundamental
Movement Skills of Elementary School Students* has been accepted to be published and printed in the
International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) Vol.11, No.3,
considering the last week of April, 2023.

Please sign the copyright agreement form, and send a scanned copy back to us.
Publication fee - APC (covers: publishing, review and databases indexing costs): 1200 USD.

It is necessary to make the payment within 7 days.
After payment, please inform us.

Closer guidelines for the payment:

If you are paying personally (if APC is not covered by your institution or fund), you can choose to
pay by bank transfer into our official bank account, in any bigger bank (You have swift code and all
necessary information in the attached document).

OR you can make an online payment (PayPal or Debit, Credit Card) following this link:

https://www.ijemst.net/apc/apc.html

When you make the payment, you need to choose OUR (you need to cover all transfer charges).

After submitting the payment you will receive an Invoice, or you can request one before payment, if your
institution or bank needs one. In that case please write all necessary information (full name of institution,
full address, VAT number, number of grants- if any, etc..).

Reminder:
Your paper must not be published elsewhere (journal, conference, etc.), in substantially the same
form, in English or in any other language.

Best Regards, Editorial Board
office, ijemstoffice@gmail.com
ijemstoffice@gmail.com

www.ijemst.net
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2 attachments

ﬂ Payment methods - Journal Publication - Rusian.pdf
— 512K

ﬂ Copyright Agreement Form.pdf
— 247K

BUDI VALIANTO budivalianto@unimed.ac.id> Sat, April 08, 2023 at 9:59
AM To: International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com

Dear International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST)

Thanks for your information
According to the email Apr. 8, 2023, APC: 1200 USD.
We have paid APC via credit card/PayPal : €1200.00 USD to IJEMST

Thank you

Attachment: PayPal
receipt Copyright
Agreement

[Quoted text hidden]
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International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) ijemstoffice@gmail.com>
Tue, April 10, 2023 at
9:43 PM To:budivalianto@unimed.ac.id

Dear BUDI VALIANTO,
your paper is now scheduled in Rusian, Vol. 11, No. 03, 2023 to be published at April 2023.

- Your final version is now being formatted

- DO NOT UPLOAD OR SEND ANOTHER VERSION, it cannot be taken into account.

- You are receiving this email because (according to the metadata in the system) you are thecorresponding
author (primary contact). However, the proof will be sent to the corresponding author given in the paper.
- On or before last week of May, 2023 you will receive a page proof from our copy-editing team

- you have 2 days to reply. If you don't respond your paper will be published as sent to you in that proof
email.'

- Check your SPAM and watch out for this email. It will be sent to the email that you have given IN THE
PAPER (and might be different from the one of this email)

- NO MODIFICATIONS WILL BE POSSIBLE ANYMORE, ONCE YOUR PAPER IS PUBLISHED.
-Please CHECK CAREFULLY authors' names, affiliations, typos....

- Changes to the content are no longer possible, this would require a new review.

Best Regards, Editorial Board office,
ijemstoffice@gmail.com
ijemstoffice@gmail.com

www.ijemst.net
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12/11/22, 9:48 PM Universitas Negeri Medan Mail - Your paper has been published in the International

M Gmall BUDI VALIANTO

<budivalianto@unimed.ac.id>

Your paper has been published in the International Journal of Education in
Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) 11-3

International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and Technology (IJEMST) <ijemstoffice@gmail.com>
Tue, April 12,2023 at 9:24
PM Bcc: budivalianto@unimed.ac.id

Dear Authors,

Your paper has been published in the International Journal of Education in Mathematics, Science and
Technology (IJEMST), Vol.11, No.3
Online version can be viewed and downloaded from www.ijemst.net

In the following days we will upload the journal content in the special bases and the catalogues.
Please check whether everything is technically in order with your paper.
Let us know if you notice some technical errors, so we can in a timely manner update the paper.

After 01 May., we will not make any corrections.
Best Regards, Editorial Board office,
jjemstoffice@gmail.com

ijemstoffice@gmail.com www.
www.ijemst.net
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