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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 11 Januari 2023 pukul 03.45
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear author,
 
We published your article as OnlineFirst. You can see your article on the web https://www.e-
iji.net/volumes/373-onlinefirst
 
 Collaboration-Based Development Model E-Learning on Course Learning Achievements Working Skills
 Mursid, Muslim, Farihah
 
We will publish as home pages on April 01, 2023.
 
Note: No changes can be made to the article after 48 hours of publication.
 
Sincerely yours
International Journal of Instruction
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.
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Dear Dr. Mursid,

Thank you. We will publish your article as OnlineFirst.

Sincerely yours
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 10 Januari 2023 pukul 00.36
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear Dr. Mursid,  

On September 17, 2022, you sent your revised article in accordance with peer-reviews. The reviewers
accepted your article as it is. We cannot change your article, so sorry. We prepared your article for
publication, and we uploaded it to the system. Your article is ready for publication. 

Sincerely yours
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

On Mon, Jan 9, 2023 at 7:05 PM R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> wrote:
Publishing Officer
International Journal of Instruction

In accordance with the revisions given by the editor, we have revised everything that has become improvements in
the article. hopefully the revision can be pleased. Here we attach proof of revision

Thanks.
Mursid
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 8 Januari 2023 pukul 00.55
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear author,
 
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.
 
We prepared your article for publication, and we uploaded it to the system. Your article is ready for
publication. We will schedule your manuscript for publication in the April 2023 issue and publish it as
OnlineFirst after you transfer the expenses of your article 1500 EUR. https://www.e-iji.net/volumes/
373-onlinefirst
 
We will send you payment information for the expenses of your article. But, some authors' payments
went back, so we could not get them. While you transfer your payment, please do not write anything as
explanation-information-purpose of payment, transaction remarks or purpose, message etc. Could
you please write only “For Gift” If you write something else, we are having trouble in the bank account.
Could you please don't write anything else.
 
Would you please follow in accordance with our instructions?
 
Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article. Others will not be
considered. You could see our valid email on: http://www.e-iji.net/about-us
 
Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 8 Januari 2023 pukul 22.38
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Publishing Officer
International Journal of Instruction

Please send us an account or bank so we can transfer 1500 EUR for the journal publication requirements in article
160622.

Thank you, 
Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 9 Januari 2023 pukul 00.26
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear Dr. Mursid,
 
If you are able to follow our following instructions, we can send you transfer information for the
expenses of your article. 

https://www.e-iji.net/volumes/373-onlinefirst
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http://www.e-iji.net/about-us
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While you transfer your payment, please do not write anything as explanation-information-
purpose of payment, transaction remarks or purpose, message etc.
 
Could you please write only “For Gift”. Could you please don't write anything else.
 
Would you please follow in accordance with our instructions?
 
Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 9 Januari 2023 pukul 08.41
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>
Cc: Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Yes, I will do that. 
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 9 Januari 2023 pukul 23.05
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Publishing Officer
International Journal of Instruction

In accordance with the revisions given by the editor, we have revised everything that has become improvements in
the article. hopefully the revision can be pleased. Here we attach proof of revision

Thanks.
Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

Changes made on Manuscript ok.docx
19K

Article 160622_for revision ok.doc
376K

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 10 Januari 2023 pukul 00.21
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>

Dear Dr. Mursid,
 
Ok, we trust you. Please never make a transfer if you cannot follow our following
instructions.
 
If possible could you please transfer 1500EUR via fast transfer. Otherwise it comes too late,
sometimes it may take a month to arrive. Please don’t transfer via Western Union, we can not receive it.
(Note: All extra fees per transaction for bank charges (intermediary and local banks) belong to the
author. We can’t send any receipt or invoice.  After payment it will not be refunded.)
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While you transfer your payment, please do not write anything as explanation-information-
purpose of payment, transaction remarks or purpose, message etc.
Could you please write only “For Gift”. Could you please don't write anything else. 
 
Account information for 1500 EUR
The name of the account holder: OMER ARI
FINANCIAL INSTITUTION: Albaraka Turk Participation Bank A. Ş.
SWIFT CODE: BTFHTRISXXX
IBAN: TR05 0020 3000 0881 1233 0000 02
Address of the bank: Albaraka Türk, TURKEY
 
Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article. Others will not be
considered. You could see our valid email on: http://www.e-iji.net/about-us
 
Note: International Journal of Instruction has a wide range of abstracting/indexing services. However, the
index services have the right of one-sided termination of the contracts and not to publish any of the
articles. Therefore, we do not accept any responsibilities caused by indexing problems.
 
Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 10 Januari 2023 pukul 10.03
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Publishing Officer
International Journal of Instruction

The author has made the payment as intended in the amount of 1500 EUR in article 160622. proof of payment is
attached.

Thanks.
Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Amendments
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International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 17 September 2022 pukul 03.57
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear author
 
You have amendments from reviewers. Could you please amend on attached file “Article 160622_for
revision” and send back your revised article and the list of explanations of the revisions done via e-mail
(editor.eiji@gmail.com) as an attached file as soon as possible?
 
So far, a lot of articles have been published in the International Journal of Instruction on a wide range of
subjects. To promote our international and scientific community, we kindly ask our writers to make
references to other articles published in our journal. By doing this, you will help us to improve the IJI and
as other writers will possibly reference your article, your article gets citations. Thus, as a final touch, we
kindly ask you to make references to two or more articles from the IJI and AJE (https://e-
aje.net).
 
Note: Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article from now on.
Others will not be considered. You could see our valid email on: http://www.e-iji.net/about-us
 
Sincerely yours,
International Journal of Instruction
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

4 lampiran

Changes made on Manuscript.docx
18K

Article 160622_for revision.doc
372K

IJI Article Evaluation Form 160622d.pdf
210K

IJI Article Evaluation Form 160622e.pdf
239K

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 17 September 2022 pukul 08.54
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>
Cc: Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Thank you, I will do that. 
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 17 September 2022 pukul 16.58
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear. IJI.
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The article has been revised according to suggestions.

We hope that it will be published soon

Thank you very much

Mursid, 
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

Changes made on Manuscript -1.docx
22K

Article 160622_for revision_01.doc
380K

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 18 September 2022 pukul 01.41
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear author
 
We received your revised article and sent it to reviewers. Thank you very much for your interest in IJI.
 
Sincerely yours
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 18 September 2022 pukul 09.44
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>
Cc: Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Thank you for your response. 
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 8 Oktober 2022 pukul 11.55
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear IJI

The article has been corrected according to the revision from IJI and we have done some citations that must be
added according to the suggestions. And the addition of the discussion of the article has been updated. For further
information, we ask for the plan when it will be published.
Thank you, I hope you can publish it.

Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 8 Oktober 2022 pukul 21.34
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear Dr. R. Mursid
 
“Article 160622”
               
This article has been completed the reviewing process and has been accepted for publication. Your
manuscript is tentatively scheduled for publication in the April 2023 issue. (Note: If in an issue the place
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opens up, articles from the next issue are taken in here.)
 
Please contact us only with this editor.eiji@gmail.com mail for your article. Others will not be
considered. You could see our valid email on: http://www.e-iji.net/about-us
 

We wish you all the best.

Editor

---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 6 November 2022 pukul 18.34
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear 
IJI Editor

Ask if the article can be published as soon as possible. due to university academic purposes. if possible we are very
grateful. may our wishes be granted. if possible in November or December 2022. 

Thank you, I hope you can publish it.

Mursid

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 7 November 2022 pukul 03.17
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear Dr. R. Mursid

Our system operates in an order. We cannot publish an article whenever we want.
However, we would like to help you. We can publish your article as OnlineFirst in January-February
2023 for the April 2023 issue.  
 
Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 5 Januari 2023 pukul 10.37
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Publishing Officer
International Journal of Instruction

Following up on articles that will be published in January-February 2023 with published volumes and numbers, asking
for certainty and furthermore whether we have received any LoA and notification of payment that we must pay.

Thank you, 
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http://www.e-iji.net/about-us
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Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 7 Januari 2023 pukul 04.35
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, farihah@unimed.ac.id

Dear Dr. Mursid,

We are preparing articles for publication. We will back you soon when your article is ready. 
We can send you an acceptance letter after your transfer of the expenses of your article. If you want to
make your transfer now, we may send you payment information for the expenses of your article.
 
Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer    
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 7 Januari 2023 pukul 17.29
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Publishing Officer
International Journal of Instruction

Good for the cost of publishing the article where we will transfer it, please inform us, we will transfer it soon and how
much it will cost. But before we transfer, when will the article be published. thank you

Thank you, 
Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

http://www.e-iji.net/
http://www.gate-academy.ch/
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R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>

article development
4 pesan

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 4 Juli 2022 pukul 11.02
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear
Editor IJI

We accept that we have to pay 1500 EUR to publish the article. When do we have to pay, please let us know. And
whether the evaluation process has been completed. I hope it can be published. 

Thank you

R. Mursid

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 7 Juli 2022 pukul 00.35
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>

Dear Dr. Mursid,
 
You don't need to transfer right now. We will send you payment information after the evaluation process,
if your article is accepted for publication. 
Your article evaluation process continues. Article evaluation process takes approximately three or five
months. We will back you as soon as possible. 
Thank you for your patience.
 
Sincerely yours,
---
International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
http://www.gate-academy.ch
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 7 Juli 2022 pukul 07.01
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Thank you for your response. 
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id> 15 September 2022 pukul 11.32
Kepada: International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com>

Dear
Editor IJI

We accept and are able to pay 1500 EUR to publish articles. When we have to pay, please let us know. And whether
the evaluation process has been completed. Hopefully it can be published.

Thank you

R. Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

http://www.e-iji.net/
http://www.gate-academy.ch/
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R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>

your article
1 pesan

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 19 Juni 2022 pukul 20.40
Kepada: R MURSID <mursid@unimed.ac.id>, Muslim <muslim@unimed.ac.id>, jurubahasa@unimed.ac.id

Dear author
 
We fixed your article and sent it to reviewers. You can see our revision on the attached file. 
 
After that, we cannot change the author. The authors of your article are as follows. We do not find it
correct to add authors to articles later.
 
You can see this "i. To add new authors to the articles isn't proper after the submission." on  http://www.e-
iji.net/notes-to-contributes
 
Collaboration-Based Development Model E-Learning on Course Learning Achievements Working Skills
 
R. Mursid
Dr., Corresponding author., Educational Technology, Postgraduate, Universitas Negeri Medan, North Sumatra, Indonesia,
mursid@unimed.ac.id

Muslim
Dr., Educational Technology, Postgraduate, Universitas Negeri Medan, North Sumatra, Indonesia, muslim@unimed.ac.id

Juru Bahasa Sinuraya
Dr., Educational Technology, Postgraduate, Universitas Negeri Medan, North Sumatra, Indonesia,
jurubahasa@unimed.ac.id

Thank you very much for your interest in IJI.

Sincerely yours,
International Journal of Instruction
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Dear Dr. Mursid,
 
We are happy to announce that the IJI is now Scopus Q1.
 
We received your article, and thank you for submitting the article to IJI for publication.
 
After a pre-assessment with careful consideration by the members of the Editorial Board and Executive
Committee, your article was decided to be accepted for further evaluation processes. However, your
manuscript was found not to be proper according to our journal’s standards, it needs revision, we will fix
your article.
 
Meanwhile, you will need to pay 1500 EUR for the expenses of your article if your article is accepted for
publication. If it is acceptable for you, let us know, and then we will start the article evaluation
process. We will send you payment information after the evaluation process, if your article is accepted
for publication. (Note: 1500 EUR be paid by all authors of an article all together. Each author does not
pay separately. The Journal management has the right to change the amount when it deems
necessary.) Could you please confirm the receipt of this e-mail?
 
Sincerely yours,
Editorial Office
International Journal of Instruction
 
Note: International Journal of Instruction has a wide range of abstracting/indexing services. However, the
index services have the right of one-sided termination of the contracts and not to publish any of the
articles. Therefore, we do not accept any responsibilities caused by indexing problems.
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To
Editor
International Teaching Journal

Thank you article will be published soon. But there is a change as the third co-author Juru Bahasa
Sinuraya replaced with Farihah
The title of the article and the composition of the author are as follows:

Collaboration-Based Development Model E-Learning on Course Learning Achievements Working Skills

R. Mursid
Dr., Corresponding author., Educational Technology, Postgraduate, Universitas Negeri Medan, North
Sumatra, Indonesia, mursid@unimed.ac.id
 
Muslim
Dr., Educational Technology, Postgraduate, Universitas Negeri Medan, North Sumatra, Indonesia,
muslim@unimed.ac.id
 
Farihah
Dr., Educational Technology, Postgraduate, Universitas Negeri Medan, North Sumatra, Indonesia,
farihah@unimed.ac.id

That's it and thank you

R. Mursid
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Ok, we will fix your article and send it to reviewers.
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Dear Dr. Mursid,

Dr. Juru Bahasa Sinuraya has to let us know that he has agreed to have his name removed from the article.
Otherwise, we cannot change the name of the third author.

Sincerely yours
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Dear Dr. Sinuraya,

Ok, at your request, we deleted your name from the article and changed the third author.

Sincerely yours
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On Mon, Jun 20, 2022 at 5:10 AM Jurubahasa Sinuraya <jurubahasa@unimed.ac.id> wrote:
Editor
International Teaching Journal

said that the third author Dr. Juru Bahasa Sinuraya can be replaced by Dr. Farihah. If it can be changed, hopefully
this third author's changes can be processed quickly

Thank you
Dr. Juru Bahasa Sinuraya
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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Great, thank you so much! 
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